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Gwen Alexandra does not need a man in her life. Especially not a man who looks like Chris Hemsworth and
Joe Manganiello's love child. One wearing leather, riding a Harley, and covered in tattoos.

Gwen can bet every pair of her Manolos that Cade Fletcher is trouble. From the moment she meets him, the
attraction sizzles between them. Gwen has a problem when it comes to attractive men in motorcycle clubs.
The last one she got involved with almost killed her.

After healing physically, Gwen decides to get a new start in a small town, half a country away from the man
who nearly cost her her life. She isn't in town five minutes when she runs into Cade, a man that is too sexy
and dangerous for his own good.

She tries to keep away from him, to ignore the attraction between them. But the biker has other ideas, soon
she is in way over her head, and her heart, and her life are in danger once again.
First in the series. No cheating & HEA
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From reader reviews:

Karen Imes:

What do you think about book? It is just for students as they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Making the Cut (The
Sons of Templar MC Book 1). All type of book is it possible to see on many solutions. You can look for the
internet methods or other social media.

Melanie Finnegan:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of
you maybe can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems
coming to you is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Making the Cut (The Sons of
Templar MC Book 1) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Joyce Tower:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the subject Making the Cut
(The Sons of Templar MC Book 1) suitable to you? Often the book was written by famous writer in this era.
Often the book untitled Making the Cut (The Sons of Templar MC Book 1)is the main one of several books
which everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this
publication you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know before. The author explained their
plan in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this publication. This
book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the
world in this particular book.

Karen Johnson:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you
go through a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, due
to the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. In order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The
Making the Cut (The Sons of Templar MC Book 1) offer you a new experience in reading a book.
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