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In The Pot and How to Use It, Roger Ebertâ€”Pulitzer Prizeâ€“winning film critic, admitted â€œcompetent
cook,â€ and long-time electric rice cooker enthusiastâ€”gives readers a charming, practical guide to this
handy and often-overlooked kitchen appliance.While The Pot and How to Use It contains numerous and
surprisingly varied recipes for electric rice cookers, it is much more than a cookbook. Originating from a
blog entry on Rogerâ€™s popular Web site, the book also includes readersâ€™ comments and recipes
alongside Rogerâ€™s own wry insights and observations on why and how we cook.With an introduction by
vegetarian cookbook author Anna Thomas and expert assistance from recipe consultant and nutritionist
Yvonne Nienstadt, The Pot and How to Use It is perfect for fans of Rogerâ€™s superb writing, as well as
anyone looking to incorporate the convenience and versatility of electric rice cookers into his or her kitchen
repertoire.Roger Ebert has been all over the news recently. An in-depth interview in Esquire in February
2010 revealed how drastically Ebertâ€™s life has changed since his recovery from life-threatening surgery
in which he lost his ability to eat, drink, and talk. He also appeared on Oprah, telling even more of his love of
life and debuting his computer generated voice, made up of clips from old TV shows and DVD reviews.

In The Pot and How to Use It, Roger Ebert--Pulitzer Prize-winning film critic, admitted "competent cook,"
and long-time electric rice cooker enthusiast--gives readers a charming, practical guide to this handy and
often-overlooked kitchen appliance.

While The Pot and How to Use It contains numerous and surprisingly varied recipes for electric rice cookers,
it is much more than a cookbook. Originating from a blog entry on Roger's popular Web site, the book also
includes readers' comments and recipes alongside Roger's own discerning insights and observations on why
and how we cook.

With an introduction by vegetarian cookbook author Anna Thomas and expert assistance from recipe
consultant and nutritionist Yvonne Nienstadt, The Pot and How to Use It is perfect for fans of Roger's superb
writing, as well as anyone looking to incorporate the convenience and versatility of electric rice cookers into
his or her kitchen repertoire.
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From reader reviews:

Teresa Dillard:

The book The Pot and How to Use It: The Mystery and Romance of the Rice Cooker give you a sense of
feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable more increase. Book can to be your best
friend when you getting stress or having big problem with your subject. If you can make examining a book
The Pot and How to Use It: The Mystery and Romance of the Rice Cooker for being your habit, you can get
more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like start and read a e-book The Pot and How to Use It: The Mystery and Romance of the
Rice Cooker. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So ,
how do you think about this guide?

Jack Johnson:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or data even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you is you don't know what type you should start with. This The Pot and How to Use It: The
Mystery and Romance of the Rice Cooker is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Jodie Kahl:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys this
kind of aren't like that. This The Pot and How to Use It: The Mystery and Romance of the Rice Cooker book
is readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
studying experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer of The
Pot and How to Use It: The Mystery and Romance of the Rice Cooker content conveys thinking easily to
understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by
means of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking The Pot and How to Use It: The Mystery and Romance of the
Rice Cooker is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Margaret Velasquez:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is referred to as of book The Pot
and How to Use It: The Mystery and Romance of the Rice Cooker. You can contribute your knowledge by it.
Without leaving behind the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is
most significant that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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