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Meet SNIFFY, THE VIRTUAL RAT! Using this CD-ROM and lab manual, you will get a hands-on
experience in setting up and conducting experiments that demonstrate the phenomena of classical and
operant conditioning using Sniffy the digital rat. Sniffy includes fifty exercises that cover every major
phenomena typically covered in a Psychology of Learning course. The CD-ROM comes with a Lab Manual
that walks you through the steps necessary to set up classical and operant conditioning experiments that
closely resemble the experiments discussed in learning texts. Throughout each, a series of "Mind Windows"
allows you to visualize how Sniffy's experiences in the chamber produce psychological changes.
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From reader reviews:

Sandra Gregory:

Typically the book Sniffy the Virtual Rat Pro, Version 3.0 (with CD-ROM) (PSY 361 Learning) will bring
that you the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to describe the idea is very
unique. When you try to find new book to learn, this book very acceptable to you. The book Sniffy the
Virtual Rat Pro, Version 3.0 (with CD-ROM) (PSY 361 Learning) is much recommended to you to study.
You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Phillip Chadwick:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family,
or their particular friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic in
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill
your own free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book might be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the publication untitled Sniffy the Virtual Rat Pro, Version 3.0 (with CD-
ROM) (PSY 361 Learning) can be fine book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Elaine Woodring:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the entire day
to reading a e-book. The book Sniffy the Virtual Rat Pro, Version 3.0 (with CD-ROM) (PSY 361 Learning)
it is rather good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. In case you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy typically the e-
book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this
book features high quality.

Andy McNeil:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many issue for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but also novel and Sniffy the Virtual Rat Pro, Version 3.0 (with
CD-ROM) (PSY 361 Learning) or even others sources were given information for you. After you know how
the good a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher as well as
students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to add their knowledge. In additional case, beside science
guide, any other book likes Sniffy the Virtual Rat Pro, Version 3.0 (with CD-ROM) (PSY 361 Learning) to
make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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