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Nationally bestselling author Madeline Hunter has thrilled her legions of fans with sensuous novels of
intrigue, adventure, and romance. Now she weaves a spectacular tale of an English knight, a Welsh rebel,
and a relationship that would defy their world and everything they believed possible between a man and a
woman...

Stealing Heaven

Marcus of Anglesmore was not at all happy about being betrothed by the king to a woman he’d never laid
eyes on. So when the brooding English knight accidentally came across her in a moonlit garden, he was both
surprised--and delighted. Intelligent, charming, and beautiful, she was the most captivating woman he’d ever
met. But the magic of that enchanted moment is soon shattered by cold reality: Nesta is not the woman he is
to marry, but her sister. Of all the women Marcus might desire, none could be more dangerous than the wild
and tantalizing Welsh witch with secret ties to both rebellion and king. For Nesta, no one could jeopardize
her plans more than a man who would know the secrets of both her heart...and her body. Yet the course of
their lives--and the destinies of their two nations--will be forever altered as they defy everything to surrender
to the most daring seduction of all....
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From reader reviews:

Todd Jacobs:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its handle may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer could be Stealing Heaven why because the great cover that make you consider with
regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the
outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Ismael Black:

Beside this specific Stealing Heaven in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh through the oven so don't
be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have Stealing Heaven
because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you
would not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this in the hand. The
Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss
this? Find this book along with read it from now!

Joshua Nichols:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul or real their
passion. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that
on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this Stealing Heaven can make you really feel more interested to read.

Juan Crowe:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different
hobby. And also you know that little person similar to reading or as looking at become their hobby. You
should know that reading is very important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to
incorporate you knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding
something by book. Numerous books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this Stealing
Heaven.
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