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Born about the year 1140 in the foothills of the Alps near Grenoble, Hugh of Avalon became a Carthusian
monk at La Grande Chartreuse, observing an ascetic discipline devoted to prayer and contemplation. In his
mid-40s, he was summoned to England to help found the first Carthusian monastery in that country at
Witham in Somersetshire. His success was such that in 1186 he was elected Bishop of Lincoln. As bishop,
Hugh helped to make Lincoln a center of learning, rebuilding the cathedral in the new Gothic style and
winning the respect of the leaders of his age, including Pope Innocent III and the kings of England, Henry II,
Richard I, and John (who helped carry the bier at Hugh's funeral in 1200).
Hugh gained a reputation for sanctity and mercy during his life thanks to his concern for the poor, his love
for children, his hospitality, and his defense of the Jews. His kindness, wit and cheerful disposition won him
a wide circle of friends, including a wild swan which guarded him while he slept and subsequently became
his chief iconographic emblem. Hugh was perhaps most famous for delivering a stinging public rebuke to
Richard I, which the king received with grave humility. Hugh was canonized a saint in AD 1220.
This edition of the Vita Sancti Hugonis, originally written by St. Hugh's contemporary Gerald of Wales, is
the earliest biography of Hugh and contains both the original Latin and a translation in English by Richard
M. Loomis. Divided into two parts, the first treats of Hugh's life, deeds, virtues and death. The second part
contains a fascinating litany of miraculous events associated with those who visited the saint's tomb. The
volume also includes a detailed introduction by the editor and an appendix containing an excerpt from the
Metrical Life of St. Hugh describing the construction of Lincoln cathedral, as well as several illustrations and
photos. Overall, the work provides an intimate portrait of one of the outstanding churchmen of the age and
offers a window into life in 12th century England.
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From reader reviews:

Lewis Lin:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. To be sure that book is
very important for people. The book Life of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop of Lincoln 1186-1200 (Fontes
Mediaevalium) seemed to be making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take
more information. It is rather advantages for you. The book Life of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop of Lincoln
1186-1200 (Fontes Mediaevalium) is not only giving you considerably more new information but also to be
your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to
make relationship while using book Life of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop of Lincoln 1186-1200 (Fontes
Mediaevalium). You never experience lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Cody Smith:

Here thing why this specific Life of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop of Lincoln 1186-1200 (Fontes
Mediaevalium) are different and reputable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good but it depends in
the content of computer which is the content is as tasty as food or not. Life of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop
of Lincoln 1186-1200 (Fontes Mediaevalium) giving you information deeper since different ways, you can
find any guide out there but there is no guide that similar with Life of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop of
Lincoln 1186-1200 (Fontes Mediaevalium). It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own eyes
about the thing which happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. It is easy to bring
everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your technique home by train. When you are having
difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Life of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop of Lincoln
1186-1200 (Fontes Mediaevalium) in e-book can be your option.

Michael Kruger:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of several ways to share
the information as well as their idea. Second, studying a book will make a person more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this Life
of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop of Lincoln 1186-1200 (Fontes Mediaevalium), it is possible to tells your
family, friends along with soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them
reading a book.

Michael Hollinger:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
wide range of stress from both way of life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will



say absolutely sure. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity
have you got when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then do you try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often
the book you have read will be Life of Saint Hugh of Avalon: Bishop of Lincoln 1186-1200 (Fontes
Mediaevalium).
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