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The study of classical electromagnetic fields is an adventure. The theory is complete mathematically and we
are able to present it as an example of classical Newtonian experimental and mathematical philosophy. There
is a set of foundational experiments, on which most of the theory is constructed. And then there is the bold
theoretical proposal of a field-field interaction from James Clerk Maxwell. 

This textbook presents the theory of classical fields as a mathematical structure based solidly on laboratory
experiments. Here the student is introduced to the beauty of classical field theory as a gem of theoretical
physics. To keep the discussion fluid, the history is placed in a beginning chapter and some of the
mathematical proofs in the appendices. Chapters on Green’s Functions and Laplace’s Equation and a
discussion of Faraday’s Experiment further deepen the understanding. The chapter on Einstein’s relativity is
an integral necessity to the text. Finally, chapters on particle motion and waves in a dispersive medium
complete the picture. High quality diagrams and detailed end-of-chapter questions enhance the learning
experience.
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From reader reviews:

Alma Bulger:

Now a day people who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources included can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specifically this The Classical Theory of
Fields: Electromagnetism (Graduate Texts in Physics) book as this book offers you rich facts and knowledge.
Of course the information in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Jennifer Phinney:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their very own reader with their story
as well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is
this The Classical Theory of Fields: Electromagnetism (Graduate Texts in Physics).

Scott Croft:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love The Classical Theory of Fields:
Electromagnetism (Graduate Texts in Physics), you could enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you
still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout men. What? Still don't have
it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Alan Malbrough:

Within this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you should
do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of many books in
the top checklist in your reading list is actually The Classical Theory of Fields: Electromagnetism (Graduate
Texts in Physics). This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning out to be
precious person. By looking up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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