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When reporter Ben Warren gains an unprecedented interview with Air Marshall, Chauer Denz, former
commander of the disgraced gunship, RNO Bristol, and now a ranking officer of the notoriously secretive
Royal Navy Orbital’s, Ministry of intelligence. He expects little more than the usual bureaucratic short
answers and misdirection, but he is astonished when he gains unparalleled access and blow by blow accounts
to some of the ministries darkest secrets, such as:

Denz’s involvement in the failure of the RNO to repulse the Koll annex of Britannia’s Devon colony, which
saw thousands dead and the loss of the planet.

The truth behind the devastating Koll invasion of Chinese space at LN-0R, which led to the single greatest
military encounter in human history, and opened the door for the Koll advance on the SOL system.

What happened to Denz and the Bristol following the Koll incursion into Earth space where five thousand
Koll warships faced off against the combined might of the Earth Defence Pact forces, in what would be the
final battle for human existence.

The inability of the EDP to stem the growing threat from bandit raiders, who have expanded from the trade
lanes into the solar system and are attacking at will.

RN, Book 1: ‘Less than zero’ is the 9,500 word introduction to a planned five book RN: series, and If you
like descriptions of alien invasions, military responses and space battles, then this book is a must.
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From reader reviews:

Debbie Davis:

The book Less than zero (RN: Book 1) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. So why must we leave the best thing like a book Less than zero (RN: Book 1)? A
number of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim which book can give many details for
us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or details that you take
for that, you can give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Less than zero (RN: Book 1) has
simple shape however you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous
world by open up and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Henry Carlino:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now's taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Less than zero (RN: Book 1) as the daily
resource information.

Violet Iverson:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that's look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can
spent the whole day to reading a e-book. The book Less than zero (RN: Book 1) it is extremely good to read.
There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. In case you did
not have enough space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this
book through your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book possesses high quality.

Jessie Davis:

The book untitled Less than zero (RN: Book 1) contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the
woman idea with easy technique. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not
necessarily worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was published by famous author. The author
brings you in the new era of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice
learn.
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