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credit $2,147.99 of which amount $1500.00 is in mortgage securities and the balance of $647.99 is in cash
on hand. The mortgages belonging to this fund are all on property in Kent county, in the City of Grand
Bapids. The interest upon these has been promptly met when due. I have found it impossible to place
desirable loans here during the past few months owing to the scarcity of good loans and the large amount of
money on hand with banks and trust 1897. j Treasurer's Report, 1896-97. 273 companies. For this reason of
the $1,441.13 now on hand ($793.14 Williams Fund and $647.99 Fellowship Fund), $1,400.00 is now
invested in certificates of deposits of the Grand Kapids National Bank ($600.00 invested December 14th,
1896, drawing 4 per cent, interest, and $800.00 invested May 18th, 1897, drawing 3 per cent, interest), and
the balance, $41.13 is on deposit in the Grand Eapids National Bank. It would seem wise that the Society
should delegate some one acquainted with the value of farm lands to visit the farms now belonging to the
society and some of those upon which we hold mortgages in order to acquaint the Society with the value and
conditions of these properties. These lands are so scattered and in some cases so distant from railway stations
that it will entail considerable work and expense. It seems, however, the only satisfactory way for the Society
to decide what dispositon to make of these farms and to learn what improvements to houses, fences, etc., are
necessary in order to best sell or rent the properties. I give herewith a statement of the receipts and
disbursements for the year. EECEIPTS. Balance on hand (last report) June 20th, 1896, $ 81 30 Interest,
Williams Fund..$ 575 67 Interest, Fellowship Fund 85 57 Membership,„ 4 00 Principal, Wil...
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From reader reviews:

Jean Young:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for us
to be aware of everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or even goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. How about the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you'll have this The Michigan Alumnus.

Timothy Holeman:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love The Michigan Alumnus, you are able
to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh
seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Katrina Scofield:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its handle may doesn't
work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer can be The Michigan Alumnus why because the excellent cover that make you
consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the
outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Rick Fountain:

Guide is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen have to have book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those guides have
many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. Through the
book The Michigan Alumnus we can have more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To become
creative person must prefer to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't possibly
be doubt to change your life at this time book The Michigan Alumnus. You can more appealing than now.
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