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An international sensation now available in English for the first time, The Violin of Auschwitz is the
unforgettable story of one man’s refusal to surrender his dignity in the face of history’s greatest atrocity.

In the winter of 1991, at a concert in Krakow, an older woman with a marvelously pitched violin meets a
fellow musician who is instantly captivated by her instrument. When he asks her how she obtained it, she
reveals the remarkable story behind its origin. . . .
  
Imprisoned at Auschwitz, the notorious concentration camp, Daniel feels his humanity slipping away.
Treasured memories of the young woman he loved and the prayers that once lingered on his lips become
hazier with each passing day. Then a visit from a mysterious stranger changes everything, as Daniel’s former
identity as a crafter of fine violins is revealed to all. The camp’s two most dangerous men use this
information to make a cruel wager: If Daniel can build a successful violin within a certain number of days,
the Kommandant wins a case of the finest burgundy. If not, the camp doctor, a torturer, gets hold of Daniel.
And so, battling exhaustion, Daniel tries to recapture his lost art, knowing all too well the likely cost of
failure. 
 
Written with lyrical simplicity and haunting beauty—and interspersed with chilling, actual Nazi
documentation—The Violin of Auschwitz is more than just a novel: It is a testament to the strength of the
human spirit and the power of beauty, art, and hope to triumph over the darkest adversity.
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From reader reviews:

Mohammed Thomas:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be smart
in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Violin of Auschwitz: A Novel
book because this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-
cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Claudia Weidner:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book that need
more time to be learn. The Violin of Auschwitz: A Novel can be your answer given it can be read by an
individual who have those short spare time problems.

Elliot Weber:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Violin of Auschwitz: A Novel can be
the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare
time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have
than the others?

Bryan Perry:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you also
know that little person including reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to know that reading
is very important as well as book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update in relation to something by book.
Different categories of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is The Violin of
Auschwitz: A Novel.
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