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Generally "theology" includes speculations about unknowable things such as what doctrines we should
believe, what rituals we should perform, and what happens to use when we die. I am not interested in these
aspects of theology.

But, I am interested in the theology of how we should behave. We should do unto others as we would have
them do to us. We should do unsolicited good deeds for those in need and love our neighbors as ourselves.
We should not respond to violence with violence if not doing so will break the cycle of violence. We should
strive to return the earth to its peaceful and clean state in the legendary time of Eden. The seven laws of
Noah include a prohibition against cruelty to animals.

Whatever god is, god is inseparable from the quest for ethics, natural law, and the project to attain the moral
perfection of humanity.

What is the connection between food and a theology of ethics? I advocate eating a green diet, an all
vegetable diet, avoiding entirely a red diet of meat and a white diet of milk products. Such a diet will make
us healthier and longer lived. It will better the environment and lessen global warming. I contend one cannot
rightfully call himself an environmentalist and not pursue a green diet.

In his Nobel Prize winning "An Inconvenient Truth" Al missed an important aspect of the theology or ethics
of our return to an Edenic environment. He said nothing about the methane emissions of 40 billion factory
farmed animals (which would not otherwise exist), a stronger global warming factor than all CO2 emissions
from all transportation modes combined. Methane is 24 times as potent a greenhouse gas as carbon dioxide.
Google for the UN report "Livestock's Long Shadow." This is a truth too inconvenient for middle-of-the-
roader Al.

Eating a green diet will avoid the goulish mistreatment of animals which goes on in secret behind the high
walls of the saturated fat industry.

We have elevated ourselves morally to the point where we no longer excuse slavery or violence against
Blacks, Jews, Gypsies, women, or homosexuals. But we still say, "Oh, come on, James, they are just
animals." We have shed our bigotries towards these others, but we remain unconscious of our bigotry toward
animals.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Brown:

The book What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For Dinner: A Theology of Food can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a
very important thing like a book What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For Dinner: A Theology of
Food? Some of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that will book can give many details
for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or info that you take for
that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book What to Serve a Goddess When
She Comes For Dinner: A Theology of Food has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can look the enormous world by start and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Margert Lewis:

This What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For Dinner: A Theology of Food book is absolutely not
ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book
is actually information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper
anyone read a lot of information you will get. This What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For Dinner:
A Theology of Food without we realize teach the one who looking at it become critical in pondering and
analyzing. Don't become worry What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For Dinner: A Theology of Food
can bring if you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it in
the lovely laptop even telephone. This What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For Dinner: A Theology
of Food having great arrangement in word and layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Douglas Leverette:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are
you experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably unlimited
right. Then do you try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the
book you have read will be What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For Dinner: A Theology of Food.

Wilson Gonzalez:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes studying, not only science book but also novel and What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For
Dinner: A Theology of Food as well as others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how
the fantastic a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or even
students especially. Those publications are helping them to put their knowledge. In various other case, beside



science reserve, any other book likes What to Serve a Goddess When She Comes For Dinner: A Theology of
Food to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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